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Visual language has been employed since early 
history till the present and is an integral part of human 
daily endeavours. According to the Visual Language 
Theory (Marriot & Meyer, 1998), the dynamics of 
visual language influence on humans is infinite. Based 
on this theory and the endless possibilities it can offer, 
the visual approach is adopted widely in the field of 
education and in the field of language acquisition. 
Vocabulary plays an important role in learning a new 
language because it is the fundamental factor that will 
determine one’s success or failure to interact in the 
new language (Leu & Kinzer, 2003). One of the popular 
methods is teaching vocabulary through games. In 
this study, the researcher had invented a game that 
can promote enthusiasm to learn English words 
through Visual Text Arranger. In this game, learners 
will respond to the riddles and images pasted on the 
wall. Learners will submit answers to a WhatsApp 
administrator who will determine the answers are 
correct or incorrect and a reward will be given to the 
selected winner. An element of technology is added 
to this game to suit the present state of young minds 
who are generally techno-freaks. In short, Visual Text 
Arranger is a versatile and fun approach to develop 
language skill and to hone the neurolinguistic aspect 
of the mind.
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